

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
2	6837521	CLUSTER II – CLUSTERED PROJECTS FOR THE COMPLETION OF BARANGAY HEALTH STATIONS, BAIS CITY							90 Calendar Days
		A. Completion of Tamisu Barangay Health Station, Barangay Tamisu, Bais City	1,386,000.00	Barangay Tamisu, Bais City	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc.	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc., Bacolod City	1,328,198.29	3/3/2020	
		B. Completion of Calasga-an Barangay Health Station, Barangay Calasga-an, Bais City	1,386,000.00	Barangay Calasga-an, Bais City	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc.	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc., Bacolod City	1,328,533.77	3/3/2020	
		C. Completion of Cambaguio Barangay Health Station, Barangay Cambaguio, Bais City	1,000,000.00	Barangay Cambaguio, Bais City	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc.	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc., Bacolod City	944,237.19	3/3/2020	
		D. Completion of Mabunao Barangay Health Station, Barangay Mabunao, Bais City	1,386,000.00	Barangay Mabunao, Bais City	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc.	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc., Bacolod City	1,328,198.29	3/3/2020	
		Grand Total	5,158,000.00				4,929,167.54		
3	6837550	COMPLETION OF SAB-AHAN BARANGAY HEALTH STATION, BARANGAY SAB-AHAN, BAIS CITY	1,000,000.00	BARANGAY SAB-AHAN, BAIS CITY	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc.	JFJ Construction and Supplies, Inc., Bacolod City	997,368.66	3/3/2020	

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

RONILO N. CABLAO
BAC Secretariat Head

ARSENIO C. ADANA, SR.
BAC Chairperson

Remarks:

Bidding was conducted on the 1st Quarter but the Post Qualification and Recommendation of Award was postponed last June 16, 2020, hence reported in the 2nd Quarter.

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid for project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

Republic of Philippines
GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

Province, City or Municipality: Bais City
2nd Quarter, CY 2020

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	7018178							9-Jun-20
1.	80	Ream	Book Paper (S-20, Long)	250.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	248.30	
2.	55	Ream	Book Paper (S-20, Short)	210.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	208.30	
3.	45	Ream	Mimeo Paper (S-20, Long)	200.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
4.	35	Ream	Mimeo Paper (S-20, Short)	195.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
5.	60	Pack	Special Paper for I D (Long), 10's/ pack	65.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	58.00	
6.	10	Box	Ballpen (Box of 50) Blue, HBW	650.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	619.00	
7.	100	Pc	Folder 14 Pts. (Long)	10.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	8.60	
8.	27	Pc	Expanding Folder (Long) Green, PX	15.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	15.00	
9.	10	Box	Fastener (Plastic Coated)	105.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	66.00	
10.	50	Pc	Double Sided Tape 1	30.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	29.00	
11.	24	Pc	High Lighter Pen (Yellow & Orange), Flex Office	30.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	29.00	
12.	20	Bot	Pentel Pen Ink (Black, Blue), Joy	55.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	51.00	
13.	1	Doz	Correction Pen, Stabillo	1,020.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	998.00	
14.	50	Pc	Brown Envelope (Long)	10.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	8.00	
15.	15	Pc	Liquid Glue Stick (Tube type, 21ml)	45.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	42.00	
16.	50	Pc	Brown Envelope (Short)	8.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	6.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
17.	20	Pc	Certificate Holder (standard size), Short	50.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	49.00	
18.	30	Cart	HP 704-Black Cartridge Ink Cart HP CN692AA (HP704) Black	550.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	548.00	
19.	30	Cart	HP 704-Tricolor Ink Cartridge Ink Cart, HP CN6963AA(HP 704) Tri color	550.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	548.00	
20.	1	Roll	Roll of cloth for streamer, 200mts	1,250.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
	7018210							
1.	20	Pc	Office Chair, Cooper Low Back	4,500.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	4,257.00	
			- Back Rest: Polypropylene (Pp) Plastic Covered With Mesh Fabric					
			- Seat: Plywood With Recycle Foam, Covered With Mesh Fabric					
			- Arm: Polypropylene (Pp) Plastic					
			- Gas Lift: Chrome					
			- Star Base: 310mm Dia. Chrome Base					
			- Wheel Caster: Pu + Nylon Wheel Caster					
			- Butterfly Mechanism = 360 Degree Swivel, Seat Height Adjustable, Tilt & Lock					
2.	1	Pc	Office Chair (black), Michael High Back	8,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	7,856.00	
			- Head Rest: Nylon Plastic Covered With Mesh Fabric.					
			- Back Rest: Nylon Plastic Frame Covered With Mesh Fabric					
			- Seat: Plywood Frame With Recycle Foam Covered With Polyester Fabric					
			- Arm: Polypropylene (Pp) Plastic					
			- Gas Lift: 100mm Length Chrome Gas Lift					
			- Star Base: 350mm Dia. Chrome Base					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Wheel Caster: Pu + Nylon Wheel Caster					
			Butterfly Mechanism = 360 Degree '- Swivel, Seat Height Adjustable, Tilt & Lock					
	7018274							
1.	1	Unit	Swivel chair/Executive Chair	4,500.00	None	None	None	
2.	2	Unit	Air Conditioner, Koppel, Non-Inverter	100,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	99,870.00	
			- Floor mounted					
			- 3 Tonner (3HP) 230 volts					
			- 1 phase, including installation & electrical supply					
			- 1 yr. warranty & services					
	7019832							
1.	1	Set	Cut Off Machine/Chop Saw	18,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	16,520.00	
			- Vise Secure with spark diversion guard					
			- Adjusting depth stop					
			- Rating: 2000W					
			- Wheel Diameter: 14 Inch					
2.	2	Set	Aluminum Extension Ladder	25,000.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
			- Aluminum Alloy 7 Steps x 3					
			- Load Capacity: 300 lbs (136 kilos)					
			- Self leveling 2-way swivel safety shoes					
3.	1	Set	HDR Photos w/ Optical Zoom	6,000.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
			- Power rating: 840W					
			- Wheel Diameter: 4 Inch					
			- No load speed at 11,000 RPM					
			- Auxiliary handle supplied					
4.	1	Set	Electric Drill, Bosch	18,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	15,510.00	
			- With Hammer, 2000RPM					
			- All metal housing					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- HD industrial 1/2" drill chuck					
5.	3	Set	Inverter Welding Machine	18,000.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
			- Current: 20 - 300Amp					
			- Single Phase 220V					
			- Built-in digital meter for accurate current reading					
			- Blower installed for ventilation					
			- Lightweight and compact design					
			Includes:					
			- 10M grounding wires and 10M cable wires					
			- Electrodes Holder/Handle with Mask					
6.	2	Set	One Bagger Concrete Mixer	80,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	77,680.00	
			- A-Frame Type with leaf spring					
			- Engine: 7.5 - 8 HP Gasoline engine with belt, pulley, bolts and nuts					
7.	1	Set	Drone	110,000.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
			- Digital Vdeo Transmission System					
			- 8kM 1080p live video, 40Mbps download speed					
			- Omnidirectional Obstacle Sensing					
			- Maps 3D view					
			- Low-light enhance photo					
			- Camera: F/2.8 to F/11 adjustable aperture,					
			- HDR Photos w/ Optical Zoom					
			- CMOS Sensor: 20Megapixels 1 Inch					
			- Photo Resolution of 45MP					
			- Up to 30 Minutes flight time, 3-axis gimbal,					
			- 8GB internal storage, SD card support up to 128GB					
			Includes:					
			- 2 set extra flight batteries					
			- battery charger hub					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- 2 set extra propellers					
			- 1 64GB SD card					
			- Remote Control					
			- carrying case					
8.	1	Set	Digital Camera	38,000.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
			- Mirrorless DSLR					
			- 24 - 26 MP APS-C CMOS Sensor					
			- 4K & Full HD Video Recording					
			- Articulating Touchscreen					
			- ISO 200-12800, 6 FPS Shooting					
			- Bluetooth & WIFI Connectivity					
			- 15 - 45MM 0.5-5.6 Lenz					
9.	1	Set	LCD Projector	30,000.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
			- RGB liquid crystal shutter projection					
			- 3600 LM Brightness Color Light Output					
			- USB Interface					
			- HDMI Input					
			- Color Contrast 15000:1					
			- Screen Projection: Std Screen 1.8-2.00M,					
			- Zoom Wide 0.89-9.12M, Zoom Tele 1.07-					
			- Sound Output					
			Includes:					
			- Screen & Stand, 2.5 M Diagonal Width					
10.	1	Set	Generator	40,000.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
			- Gasoline Powered 7.5 HP OHV					
			- Single cylinder, air cooled, 4 stroke					
			- 15 L Gasoline Tank					
			- Control Panel: Voltmeter, Circuit Breaker					
			- Type: Brush (AVR), single phase					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Rated A.C. Output: 3200-6000W					
			- Max A.C. Output: 4000-6500W					
	7019863							
1.	1	Unit	Drone, Aircraft, Mavic 2 Zoom with Fly More Kit (with Brochure)	200,000.00	Wattsavers Energy Services Co.	Wattsavers Energy Services Co., Antipolo, Rizal	179,295.60	
			- Weight : 905 g					
			- Max Speed : 44.7mph (72kph) in sport mode without wind					
			- Max Service Ceiling : 19685 ft (6000m) above sea level					
			- Operating Temperature : 14° to 104°F (-10° TO 40°C)					
			- GNSS : GPS + GLONASS					
			- Operating Frequency : 2.4-2.4835 GHz; 5.725-5.850 GHz					
			- Transmitter Power : 2.4 GHz					
			- (EIRP) : FCC: <26dBm; CE/MIC : <20 dBm; SRRC: <20 dBm 5.8GHz					
			- (EIRP) : FCC: <26dBm; CE <14 dBm; SRRC: <26 dBm					
			Gimbal					
			- Controllable Range : Pitch: -90° to +30°					
			Camera					
			- Sensor : 1/2.3" CMOS; Effective pixels:12M					
			- Electronic Shutter Speed : 8-1/8000 s					
			- Video : MP4, MOV (MPEG-4 AVC/H.264, HEVC)					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Supported SD Cards : micro SD 128 GB (UHS-I Speed Grade 3 rating required)					
			Remote Controller					
			- Operating Frequency : 2.4-2.4835 GHz; 5.725-5.850 GHz					
			- Max Transmission Distance : FCC: 5 mi (8 km); CE/MIC: 3.1 mi (5km);					
			- Battery : 3950 mAh @ 3.83V					
			- Transmitter Power : 2.4 GHz					
			- Size : Supported USB port types: Lighting, Micro USB (Type-B) USB-C					
			- Energy : 59.29 Wh					
			Including:					
			- 1 set extra flight batteries					
			- Battery charger hub					
			- Battery to power bank adaptor					
			- Extra propellers					
			- Carrying case					
2.	2	Unit	Canon Pixma MP237 Printer/Copier/Scanner with CISS and Elite Premium Inks	12,000.00	Wattsavers Energy Services Co.	Wattsavers Energy Services Co., Antipolo, Rizal	11,220.00	
	7030258							16-Jun-20
1.	1	Unit	Rescue Vehicle	2,500,000.00	Fast Autoworld Phils. Corporation	Fast Autoworld Phils. Corporation, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	2,430,000.00	
			- Body Type: Pick-up Truck					
			- Model: Latest Model, Top of the line, 2020					
			- Transmission/Engine Type: In-line 4 cylinder, 181HP, Manual Transmission					
			- Engine Displacement: 2.4 liters Diesel Engine					

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	- Fuel System: Turbo-Diesel Direct Injection, Euro IV compliant					
	- Drivetrain: 4x4 (4wd)					
	- Tire: 18 inch Magnesium Alloy rims with 265/80 R18 Off-road type tires					
	- Safety Features: ABS and Airbag System (minimum safety requirement)					
	- Custom-Built Features for Rescue: Color - Silver Gray, Standard Blinker, Standard Siren, Strobe Light, Dash Camera,GPS Navigation Device, Public Address System, Heavy Duty Towing Hook, Motorized Towing Winch (front mounted)					
	- Leather Seat cover, Tint, Front bumper Bullbar with Fog lamps,					
	- Rollbar with basket, Early warning device (EWD-LTO compliant), Intake manifold,					
	- Flood snorkel, Ground Clearance 330mm (minimum), Basic Tools (Jack, Tire wrench, ETC.)					
	Note:					
	- Free Decals (See Design)					
	- Free one (1) Year Registration and Insurance (Registered in the name of Bais)					
	- After sale services 3 years warranty on parts and services, Automotive Repair Shop, located within Negros Island					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	7030351							
1.	1	Unit	Pick up Truck	1,800,000.00	Fast Autoworld Phils. Corporation	Fast Autoworld Phils. Corporation, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	1,780,000.00	
			-Brand New					
			- Double-cabin configuration with aircon system					
			-Four-cylinder diesel engine with displacement not lower than 2.4 liters					
			-4x4 manual transmission					
			-Free three (3) years LTO registration and TLP insurance					
			-Warranty for 3 years or 100,000 kms (whichever comes first)					
			-With Jack, tire wrench and Basic tools					
			-Brand new mag wheels 18" tires with spare					
	7030374							
			CHO					
1.	5,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	
2.	1,000	Lt	Unleaded Gasoline	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	58.00	
			CMO					
3.	7,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	
4.	1,000	Lt	Unleaded Gasoline	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	58.00	
			CSWD					
5.	2,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	7030398							
1.	20	Set	Tire with Inner Tube and Flap, Vikrant, India	15,000.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	12,290.00	
			-10.00 x 20, 16 PR					
			-288mm Section width, minimum					
2.	4	Set	Tire with Inner Tube and Flap, 14.0 X 24, JK Tyre, India	32,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	27,940.00	
	7030414							
1.	14,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	
	7030423							
			C.E.O.					
1.	9700	Lt	Diesel, Exceed	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	
2.	920	Lt	Unleaded Gasoline, Xtreme	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	58.00	
			C.M.O.					
3.	4000	Lt	Diesel, Exceed	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	
4.	1000	Lt	Unleaded Gasoline, Xtreme	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	58.00	
			C.T.O.					
5.	300	Lt	Diesel, Exceed	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	
6.	80	Lt	Unleaded Gasoline, Xtreme	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	58.00	
	7030441							
1.	13,000	Lt	Diesel, Exceed	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	
			CHO					
3.	3,000	Lt	Diesel, Exceed	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	47.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	7010136							18-Jun-20
1.	1	Unit	Brand New Mobile Kitchen, Howo YC4S140	4,500,000.00	KFour Enterprises	KFour Enterprises, Cabaruan, Cauayan City Isabela	4,295,000.00	
			- Completely Build Up Unit (CBU)					
			- Engine: 4-Cylinder Diesel Engine					
			- Horsepower: 138 HP (103 KW)					
			- Tire size: 8.25 R16 w/ spare					
			Kitchen Body Specifications:					
			-with 15 kva generator diesel					
			- with stainless water tank for clean water and another tank for waste water					
			- Stainless kitchen sink w/ faucet w/ stainless chopping table					
			- with ceiling lightings, w/ side wall mount electrical fan					
			- with ceiling opening for ventilation and sealed type to prevent water going inside the kitchen					
			- with three (3) push and pull air spring type window for ventilation located at kitchen body (driver side)					
			- with big rectangular side air spring type opening (passenger side) w/ folding narrow dropside table for eating					
			- with 2-diesel burner for cooking; w/ stainless steel ladder for rooftop					
			- with roof railing; w/ rear door opening for entry of kitchen personnel					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- with\ storage compartment located below the exterior kitchen body (driver side)					
			- with generator storage compartment w/ slide type frame for generator for preventive maintenance of generator					
			- with non-slip flooring (aluminum) with drain, easy to clean up.					
			- with AC sockets for kitchen appliances; includes 1 unit Freezer (chest type)					
			- Decals stickers of LGU name; LTO Registration under LGU name; 1 year warranty					
			- Delivery: 60 days after acknowledgement of Purchase Order (PO)					
2.	1	Unit	Water Tanker (brand new)	5,000,000.00	KFour Enterprises	KFour Enterprises, Cabaruan, Cauayan City Isabela	4,735,000.00	
			- 10,000 liter capacity					
			- Stainless steel tank					
			- 6 Cylinder, YC6J200, 147 hp diesel engine					
			- 9.00 x 20 tire size w/ spare					
			- Decals stickers of LGU name; LTO Registration under LGU name; 2 years warranty					
			- Delivery : 60 days after acknowledgement of Purchase Order (PO)					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	7045185							23-Jun-20
1.	631	Bot	Larvicide, Good Quality, Temephos 1% Gr., 250grms, Unique Dispenser Cap	950.00	4A Agrosience Corporation	4A Agrosience Corporation, Mandaue City	950.00	
2.	2480	Bot	Impregnation Solution (Deltametrin Isc), 40ml per Bottle	199.00	4A Agrosience Corporation	4A Agrosience Corporation, Mandaue City	199.00	
	7045217							
1.	200	Box	Amoxicillin Trihydrate 500mg/capsule, 100's	355.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	220.00	
2.	200	Box	Amoxicillin Trihydrate 250mg/capsule, 100's	168.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	150.00	
3.	300	Bot	Amoxicillin 100 mg/ml oral drops, 15 ml	35.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	25.00	
4.	300	Bot	Amoxicillin 250 mg/5 ml suspension, 60 ml	55.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	35.00	
5.	300	Bot	Cotrimoxazole 400mg/80mg/5ml susp, 60 ml	45.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	32.00	
6.	200	Box	Cotrimoxazole 800mg/160mg tablet, 100's	240.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	215.00	
7.	750	Tab	Cefuroxime 500 mg/tablet	28.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	20.73	
8.	200	Bot	Cefuroxime 250 mg/susp, 60 ml	225.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	212.00	
9.	300	Box	Cefalexin 250 mg capsule, 100's	255.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	218.00	
10.	200	Box	Cefalexin 500 mg capsule, 100's	610.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	475.00	
11.	300	Bot	Cefalexin 100 mg/ml, Diacef	28.00	RPB Commercial	RPB Commercial, Dumaguete City	27.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
12.	300	Bot	Cefalexin 250 mg/5ml susp, 60 ml	43.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	40.999	
13.	200	Bot	Cetirizine 2.5 mg/ml, Oral Drop, 10ml	120.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	44.60	
14.	200	Bot	Cetirizine syrup, 5 mg/ml, 60 ml	135.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	44.60	
15.	100	Box	Cetirizine 10 mg/tablet, 100's	860.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	117.00	
16.	300	Bot	Co-Amoxiclav 400mg+57mg/5ml susp, 70 ml, Clomived	282.00	RPB Commercial	RPB Commercial, Dumaguete City	280.00	
17.	1000	Tab	Co-amoxiclav 625mg/tablet	25.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	15.00	
18.	150	Box	Ciprofloxacin 500 mg/tab, 100's	684.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	260.00	
19.	500	Bot	Salbutamol 2 mg/5ml syrup, 60 ml	33.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	22.00	
20.	300	Box	Salbutamol 2 mg/tablet, Box of 100's	88.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	38.50	
21.	40	Box	Salbutamol 1 mg/ml nebule, 2.5 ml, Box of 30 Nebule	375.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	348.00	
22.	100	Tube	Mupirocin, 2% ointment, Tube, 5g	175.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	108.00	
23.	200	Box	Prednisone 10mg/tablet, Box of 100's	420.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	228.00	
24.	300	Bot	Paracetamol 100mg/ml drops	31.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	23.00	
25.	300	Box	Paracetamol 250mg/ml, 60 ml	55.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	30.00	
26.	500	Box	Paracetamol 500 mg/tablet, 100's	146.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	89.00	
27.	150	Bot	Oral Rehydration Salts (ORS) Sachet 5.575 grams	12.50	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	7.90	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	7038234							
1.	100	Box	Allopurinol 100mg, tablet, 100's	275.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	189.00	
2.	50	Box	Aluminum Magnesium Hydroxide tablet, 100's	230.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	140.00	
3.	270	Box	Amlodipine 10 mg tablet, 100's	600.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	210.00	
4.	100	Tab	Azithromycin 500 mg, tablet	60.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	43.00	
5.	50	Box	Calcium Carbonate+ Cholecalciferol (Vit. D3) 600mg elemental Ca + 400 IU Vit. D3 tablet. 100's. Oscivit	400.00	RPB Commercial	RPB Commercial, Dumaguete City	398.00	
6.	100	Box	Captopril 25 mg tablet, 100's	225.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	150.00	
7.	1000	Tab	Cefuroxime 500 mg, tablet	35.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	29.50	
8.	200	Box	Cetirizine 10 mg tablet, 100's	300.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	120.00	
9.	1000	Tab	Co-Amoxiclav 625 mg (500 mg + 125 mg) tablet	25.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	18.00	
10.	50	Box	Diphenhydramine Hcl 50 mg capsule, 100's	175.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	120.00	
11.	100	Box	Gliclazide 60 mg MR tablet, 100's, Melanov MR	1,390.00	RPB Commercial	RPB Commercial, Dumaguete City	1,385.00	
12.	200	Box	Losartan 100mg/tablet, 100's	850.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	500.00	
13.	50	Box	Mefenamic Acid 500 mg capsule, 100's	180.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	169.00	
14.	500	Box	Metformin Hcl mg tablet, 100's	250.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	120.00	
15.	500	Box	Metoprolol 50 mg tablet, 100's	225.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	95.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
16.	50	Box	Omeprazole 20 mg capsule, 100's	505.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	335.00	
17.	100	Box	Paracetamol 500 mg tablet, 100's	100.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	76.00	
18.	20	Box	Ranitidine Hcl 150 mg/tablet, 100's	300.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	139.00	
19.	50	Box	Simvastatin 20 mg/tablet, 100's	480.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	180.00	
	7038241							
1.	18	Pc	Wheelchair, Folded Fixed, Adult Size	8,000.00	Berovan Marketing, Inc.	BMI, Mandaue City	4,080.00	
	7045223							
1.	2	Unit	Portable Computer (Laptop), Lenovo Ideapad L3	59,000.00	Acelogic Computer Solutions	ACS, Dumaguete City	58,950.00	
			- USB External DVD Writer Drive					
			- 1TB Hard Disk Drive					
			- Microsoft Windows 10 Professional					
			- 8GB DDR4 Memory					
			- Operating System Architecture : 64-Bit					
			- Number of Ports : HDMI out, two USB 2.0 port, one USB 3.0 port					
			- Intel Core i5-10210 Processor					
			- All-in-One Card Reader					
			- IEEE 802.11n Eireless LAN; Gigabit LAN					
			- Nvidia GeForce MX130, 2GB Video Card					
			- LED Backlight					
			- 15.6HD Screen Display					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Country of Origin : China					
2.	2	Sftwre	Anti-Virus, 2 Years License validity, good for 3 PCs, Kaspersky	5,000.00	Acelogic Computer Solutions	ACS, Dumaguete City	2,300.00	
	7010190							
1.	1	Lot	Decontamination Tent (see drawing details)	10,000.00	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	185,000.00	
2.	3	Unit	Canopy (fabrication) 3 x 6 (see drawing details), 1¼ S40 Local	50,000.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dumaguete City	27,100.00	
3.	20	Unit	Canopy (fabrication) 3 x 3 (see drawing details), 1¼ S40, Local	25,000.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dumaguete City	16,200.00	
4.	2	Unit	Push Cart	3,500.00	No bid	No bid	None	
			- Size 24"x 36", 300 kgs					
			- Platform Trolley					
5.	1	Unit	Flood light w/ built-in generator	150,000.00	No bid	No bid	None	
			- Max Height 4.5/5.5m					
			- Section: 3/4 section					
			- Lifting: Manual Lifting					
			- Light: LED					
			- Light Power: 4x100W					
			- Total Lumen: 4x11000Lm					
			- Generator Power: 1-8kw					
			- Frequency:220V/50Hz					
			- Cooling System: Air-cooled					
			- Fuel: Gasoline					
6.	50	Pc	Cadaver Bags (brand new)	2,500.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	VE, Dumaguete City	1,818.00	
			- L:76"-90", W:35"-36",					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Waterproof cloth, made of PVC, double plane					
			- Strap w/ zipper					
7.	3	Unit	Water Tank (portable)	45,000.00	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	160,000.00	
			- 10,000 liter capacity					
			- Polyethylene					
	7010213							
1.	4	Unit	Portalet (Portable Toilet), with Brochure	90,000.00	Bethyl Enterprises	Bethyl Enterprises, Dumaguete City	82,000.00	
			- Brand New (unused)					
			- Fixed 227L Waste Tank					
			- Made of Plastic					
			- Size: 1.15m x 1.15m x 2.3m					
2.	200	Unit	Modular Tent w/ mosquito net, with Pictures	5,000.00	DVK Phils. Enterprises	DVK Phils. Enterprises, Taguig City, Metro Manila	3,920.00	
			- Size: 240 x 240x180 cm					
			- Capacity: 7-8 person capacity					
			- Material: Polyester, waterproof					
			- Foldable, with carrying bag					
			- Capacity: >10					
			- Pole Material: Galvanized					
			- Color: White					
			- Size: 13.7 x 6m or 6.85x6m					
			- Material: Canvas					
3.	2	Unit	Emergency Medical Tent (see drawing details)	250,000.00	Bethyl Enterprises	Bethyl Enterprises, Dumaguete City	235,000.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Size: 6m x 16m					
			- With 2 sidewalls with windows, 2 sidewalls with foldable door					
			- 3/4 inch marine plywood flooring w/ rubber mat					
			- Maruyama White Roofing w/ heat insulator and sidewalls					
			- Probation for 2 exhaust fan frame (0.40mx0.40m)minimum					
			- G.I. flaming (see detailed drawing)					
	7038255							
1.	150	Box	Metformin HCL 500 mg, 100 tab/box	250.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	120.25	
2.	100	Box	Glibenclamide 5 mg, 100 tab/box	1,000.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	96.25	
3.	120	Box	Gliclazide 80 mg MR, 100 tab/box	1,400.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	380.00	
4.	150	Box	Metoprolol 100 mg, 100 tab/box	275.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	207.00	
5.	100	Box	Metoprolol 50 mg, 100 tab/box	250.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	97.50	
6.	125	Box	Losartan 50 mg, 100 tab/box	500.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	245.00	
7.	100	Box	Losartan 100 mg, 100 tab/box	850.00	Buenavida Pharma	Buenavida Pharma, Davao City	550.00	
8.	150	Box	Amlodipine 5 mg, 100 tab/box	300.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	102.20	
9.	100	Box	Amlodipine 10 mg, 100 tab/box	600.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	130.00	
10.	35	Unit	Digital Blood Glucose Monitoring System, Auto Coding, Strip Ejector	2,800.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	1,487.50	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
11.	300	Box	Blood Glucose Test Strips 25 pc/box	900.00	V Five Marketing	V Five Marketing, Sibulan, Neg. Or.	700.00	
	7038273							
1.	100	Unit	Modular Tent w/ mosquito net, with Brochure	5,000.00	Danda Designs and Concepts, Inc.	Danda Designs and Concepts, Inc., Pateros Metro Manila	4,200.00	
			- Size: 240 x 240 x 180 cm					
			- Capacity: 7-8 person capability					
			- Material: Polyester, waterproof					
			- Foldable, with carrying bag					
			- Capacity: >10					
			- Pole material: Galvanized					
			- Color: White					
			- Size: 13.7 x 6m or 6.85x6m					
			- Material: Canvas					
	7033318							30-Jun-20
1.	1	Unit	6 Wheeler Brand New Garbage Compactor, FAW 220 R6 Dragon V Model	4,000,000.00	KJMB Commercial	KJMB Commercial, Quezon City	3,420,000.00	
			- 220 Hp minimum, FAW CA6DLD-22ES Diesel Engine					
			- 8 cubic meter volume push-type					
			- Tire size 11 R22.5 with spare					
			- With Jack, Tire wrench and Basic tools					
			- Fully air conditioned					
			- 6600 ml Displacement					
			- Euro V Emission Standard					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- 6 speed manual transmission					
			- with Megaphone & Sound System					
	7033358							
1.	1	Unit	6 Wheeler Brand New Garbage Compactor, FAW 220 R6 Dragon V Model	4,000,000.00	KJMB Commercial	KJMB Commercial, Quezon City	3,588,000.00	
			- 220 Hp minimum, FAW CA6DLD-22ES Diesel Engine					
			- 8 cubic meter volume push-type					
			- Tire size 11 R22.5 with spare					
			- With Jack, Tire wrench and Basic tools					
			- Fully air conditioned					
			- 6600 ml Displacement					
			- Euro V Emission Standard					
			- 6 speed manual transmission					
			- with Megaphone & Sound System					

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

RONILO N. CABLAO
BAC Secretariat Head

ARSENIO C. ADANA, SR.
BAC Chairperson

