

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

Republic of the Philippines  
CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT  
Province, City or Municipality: **Bais City**  
4th Quarter, CY 2020

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
					-NA-				

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

Prepared by:

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
-----	---------------	-----------------	------------------------------	----------	----------------	------------------	------------	--------------	-------------------

**CHAVELLE F. ALONSO**  
Member- BAC Secretariat

**RONILO N. CABLAO**  
BAC Secretariat Head

**MA. ANGELES SOCORRO A. A. BANOON, CE, EnP, CSEE**  
BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

Republic of Philippines  
GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

Province, City or Municipality: Bais City  
4th Quarter, CY 2020

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	<b>7223604</b>							<b>13-Oct-20</b>
			City Health Office (CHO)					
1.	6,000	Lt	Diesel, Exceed	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	45.00	
2.	1,000	Lt	Gasoline, Unleaded	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	55.00	
			City Mayor's Office (CMO)					
1.	10,000	Lt	Diesel, Exceed	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	45.00	
2.	1,000	Lt	Gasoline, Unleaded	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	55.00	
	<b>7223625</b>							
1.	14,000	Lt	Diesel, Fuel	50.00	Boss Petrol Station	Boss Petrol Station, Bindoy, Neg. Or.	48.00	
	<b>7223656</b>							
1.	14,000	Lt	Diesel, Total	50.00	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading, Dgte. City	45.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
2.	2,000	Lt	Gasoline, Total	60.00	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading, Dgte. City	55.00	
	<b>7239093</b>							<b>20-Oct-20</b>
1.	200	Pc	2" x 2" x 10' Coco lumber(first class)	106.67	No bid.	No bid.	None	
2.	112	Pc	2" x 4" x 12 Coco lumber (first class)	256.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
3.	112	Pc	2" x 3" x 12' Coco lumber( first class)	192.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	
4.	28	Sht	5mm x 1.20m x 2.40m Ordinary Plywood	480.00	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	500.00	
5.	60	Kg	4" C.W. Nails	65.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	53.90	
6.	40	Kg	3" C.W. Nails	65.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	53.90	
7.	40	Kg	2 1/2" C.W. Nails	70.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	59.00	
8.	7	Kg	1 1/2" C.W. Nails	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	59.00	
9.	160	Bag	Portland Cement, Grand Premium	265.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	229.00	
10.	16	CuM	Sand (washed), Tanjay Source	650.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	628.00	
11.	9	CuM	Gravel 1 1/2" dia., Tanjay Source	750.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	728.00	
12.	185	Lgth	12mm dia x 6.0m def. bar	235.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	204.00	
13.	192	Lgth	10mm dia. x 6.0m def. bar	175.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	138.80	
14.	30	Lgth	16mm dia. x 6.0m def. bar	500.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	372.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
15.	10	Pc	Hacksaw blade, 18T, Lenox	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	38.00	
16.	60	Kg	#16 G.I. tie wire	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	56.80	
	<b>7239139</b>							
1.	16,000	Lt	Diesel, Fuel	50.00	Boss Petrol Station	Boss Petrol Station, Bindoy, Neg. Or.	48.00	
	<b>7239570</b>							
1.	6	Drum	Hydraulic Oil AW68, D200, S-Oil	26,000.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	20,000.00	
2.	6	Drum	Engine Oil 15W40, D200, Petron HD4X	26,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	22,237.00	
3.	6	Drum	Engine Oil HD40 D200, Petron	26,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	20,606.00	
4.	2	Drum	Gear Oil GEP 140 P200, Atlantic	26,000.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	22,000.00	
5.	10	Box	Brake Fluid 300 ml/24, National	3,100.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	1,560.00	
	<b>7239656</b>							
1.	20	Set	Tire with Inner Tube & Flap, 10.00 x 20, 16 PR, 288mm Section width, minimum, Vikrant, Lug, India	15,000.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	12,300.00	
2.	10	Set	Tire with Inner Tube & Flap, 9.00 x 20, 16 PR, Kelcea, Lug Type, Sri-Langka	12,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	11,220.00	
	<b>7239798</b>							
1.	2	Drum	Engine Oil # 40, D200, Petron HD40	26,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	20,606.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	2.	2	Drum	Hydraulic Oil AW 68, D200, S-Oil	26,000.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	20,000.00
	3.	1	Box	Brake Fluid, National, 300ml/24	3,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	1,580.00
	4.	4	Drum	Gear Oil, Atlantic, 140W	25,000.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	22,000.00
	<b>7239837</b>							
	1.	6	Set	Tire with Inner Tube and Flap, 14.00 x 24, Deestone	36,000.00	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc.	New Bian Yek Commercial, Inc., Dgte. City	26,000.00
	2.	4	Set	Tire with Inner Tube and Flap, 18.4 x 24, Goodride EL23	46,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	28,502.00
	<b>7239931</b>							
	1.	12	Pc	Tubeless tire 195R15C (Ambulance #030107, B5W283 & B5U934), Linam, Japan	6,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	4,320.00
	2.	8	Pc	Tubeless tire 195R14C (KIA Van EG 8058 & Ambulance SJP 336)), Falken, Indonesia	5,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	3,540.00
	3.	4	Pc	Tire w/ inner tube & flap 7.50 x 15, lug type (Toyota D/cab #073210), Innovative, India	7,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	6,170.00
	4.	2	Pc	Battery 12V/11P, MF (Ambulance #030107 & SJP 336), Motolite Enduro	7,000.00	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc.	Dgte. AVM Battery Enterprises, Inc., Dgte. City	6,580.00
	<b>61706</b>							
	1.	6,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	45.00
								<b>27-Oct-20</b>

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	2.	1,000	Lt	Gasoline	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	55.00
				City Mayor's Office (CMO)				
	1.	10,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	45.00
	2.	1,000	Lt	Gasoline	60.00	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station	Nicolas G. Toledo Jr. Fuel Station, Basay, Neg. Or.	55.00
		<b>61727</b>						
	1.	14,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Boss Petrol Station	Boss Petrol Station, Bindoy, Neg. Or.	48.00
		<b>7223586</b>						
	1.	14,000	Lt	Diesel	50.00	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading, Dgte. City	45.00
	2.	2,000	Lt	Gasoline	60.00	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading	Thundergale Lubes and Fuels Trading, Dgte. City	55.00
		<b>7282908</b>						<b>3-Nov-20</b>
	2.	2	Set	Color Printer with Scanner	12,000.00	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	Above the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)	18,000.00
				- 4 Cartridge (CMYB) Micro Piezo Print Head w/ Built-In or Pre Installed CISS				
	3.	2	Unit	Typewriter, Brand New, Olympia SG3 24"	50,000.00	Acelogic Computer Solutions	Acelogic Computer Solutions, Dgte. City	30,000.00
		<b>7283015</b>						
				<b>I. Agricultural Equipments/Supplies and Materials</b>				
	1.	7	Unit	Brand New Agricultural Power Sprayer, 6.5HP, to include accessories, Good Quality Heavv-duty, Echiban	18,450.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	9,750.00

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
2.	8	Unit	Power Hose (Power Sprayer Compatible) 100 mtrs./unit. Good Quality	3,300.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	3,295.00	
3.	32	Unit	Knapsack sprayer (steel type) 16 ltrs. Cap., Good Quality Heavy-duty	4,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	3,620.00	
4.	1	Unit	Grass Cutter, Heavy-duty (Petrol fuel- fed, 2 stroke) Good Quality, Kawasaki	16,450.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	9,907.00	
5.	50	Drum	Empty Plastic Drums, blue color, 200 ltrs. Cap. Good Quality with Intact Covers on both ends	2,500.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	2,421.00	
6.	35	Pc	Hard Hat (plastic), good quality, MT	210.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	115.00	
7.	35	Pair	Rainboots, Heavy-duty, various sizes, Camel	300.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	288.00	
8.	33	bot/lt	Rechargeable Head Lamp Heavy-duty, Good Quality, OEM	480.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	395.00	
9.	35	Pc	N95 face mask, heavy-duty good quality, 3M	190.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	149.00	
10.	35	Pc	Safety Eyewear/Ear protector, Ingco	385.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	248.00	
11.	35	Pair	Rubber gloves, good quality, heavy-duty	65.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	51.00	
12.	35	Pc	Rain coat, Poncho type, heavy-duty, good quality	300.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	295.00	
13.	10	Bag	Rice/Corn Bran at 50 kg./bag (for insect Baiting System)	1,285.52	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	1,280.00	
			<b>II. Other Agricultural Supplies</b>					
14.	40	Pack	Sevin 85 WP	319.00	No bid	No bid	None	
15.	40	Pack	Lannate 40 SP	577.50	No bid	No bid	None	



	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
16.	50	bot/lt	Karate 2.5 EC	1,149.50	No bid	No bid	None	
17.	33	bot/lt	Bida 2.5 EC	682.00	No bid	No bid	None	
18.	31	bot/lt	Magnum 5 EC	445.50	No bid	No bid	None	
19.	32	bot/lt	Pennant 500 EC	852.50	No bid	No bid	None	
20.	32	bot/lt	Salvo 50 EC	808.50	No bid	No bid	None	
21.	35	bot/lt	Vindex	935.75	No bid	No bid	None	
	<b>7283033</b>							
1.	4	Box	Sign pen, BX-V7, blue, Pilot	1,300.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	817.00	
2.	5	Box	Sign pen, BX-V7, black, Pilot	1,300.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	817.00	
3.	10	Pad	Adhesive notepad, 2"x3"	50.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	37.00	
4.	10	Box	Clip, back fold, 1" wide	60.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	55.35	
5.	2	Box	Strong elastic rubber band, 70mm, #20-#30	150.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	149.00	
6.	6	Box	Pencil with eraser, high quality, Mongol	110.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	109.00	
7.	10	Pc	Correction tape, high quality, 10 meters	80.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	47.00	
8.	5	Doz	Folder, long, white	100.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	66.00	
9.	3	Doz	Folder, short, white	80.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	65.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
10.	6	Doz	Envelope, documentary, long, brown	100.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	66.00	
11.	3	Doz	Envelope, documentary, short, brown	70.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	65.00	
12.	30	Pc	Expanding folder, green	30.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	20.00	
13.	5	Pack	Colored paper, soft green plain, 20 sheets per pack	90.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	52.20	
14.	6	Pack	Photo paper, glossy, A4, pack of 20	100.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	90.00	
15.	30	Ream	Bond paper, subs, 20, long	400.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	267.00	
16.	20	Ream	Bond paper, subs, 20, short	350.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	245.00	
17.	2	Doz	highlighter, green and yellow	550.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	540.00	
18.	4	Pc	water-well paste	80.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	65.80	
19.	1	Bot	Glue, all-purpose, 200-400 grams	400.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	135.00	
20.	5	Pc	Duct tape, gray	160.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	140.00	
21.	8	Bot	Epson ink, black refill, 664	400.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	338.00	
22.	5	Bot	Epson ink, yellow-refill, 664	400.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	360.00	
23.	5	Bot	Epson ink, magenta-refill, 664	400.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	360.00	
24.	5	Bot	Epson ink, cyan, refill, 664	400.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	360.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
25.	4	Pc	Certificate frame, 8.5"x 11", wood	150.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	138.00	
26.	1	Box	Correction Pen	1,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	885.00	
27.	2	Doz	Plastic envelope, long	150.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	132.00	
28.	2	Box	Fastener, plastic	80.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	48.00	
29.	2	Box	Fastener, Metal, long	150.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	137.00	
30.	2	Box	Marker, permanent, broad type, black	1,000.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	595.00	
31.	6	Bot	Stamp pad INK, blue	80.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	48.00	
32.	8	Box	Staple wire, no. 35	100.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	72.00	
33.	10	Pc	Transparent Tape, 2 inches. up to 50 meters	80.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	68.50	
34.	1	Box	White board marker, black	800.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	732.00	
35.	5	Box	Regular Sign Pen, blue	800.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	497.00	
36.	5	Box	Regular Sign Pen, black	800.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	497.00	
	<b>7283098</b>							
1.	10	Ream	Bond Paper 8 1/2 x 14, Substance 20, Cactus	280.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	277.00	
2.	100	Ream	Book Paper substance 20 (long), A1	265.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	253.00	
3.	100	Ream	Book Paper substance 20 (short), A1	250.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	230.00	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
4.	6	Box	Ball pen (box of 50's), best quality ( black & blue)	350.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	309.00	
5.	2,000	Pc	Brown envelope, shiny (long)	6.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	4.90	
6.	100	Pc	Brown envelope, shiny (short)	4.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	3.80	
7.	2	Box	Carbon Paper, non-smudge (black & blue), TM	860.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	650.00	
8.	100	Pc	Cartolina, good quality (assorted color)	8.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	7.80	
9.	12	Pc	Columnar Notebook, 22 columns	70.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	63.70	
10.	100	Pc	Correction tape, good quality, TM, HBW	25.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	23.40	
11.	1	Box	Correspondence envelope (box of 500), long	400.00	AC/DC Enterprises		395.00	
12.	10	Pc	Document keeper, hard box (green) long	175.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	167.00	
13.	12	Bot	Epson ink refill, T6641 (black) genuine, 70ml	350.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	338.00	
14.	3	Bot	Epson ink refill, T6642 (cyan) genuine, 70ml	350.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	344.00	
15.	3	Bot	Epson ink refill, T6644 (yellow)genuine, 70ml	350.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	344.00	
16.	250	Pc	Expanding envelope, long, shiny, elastic tie (yellow & green)	18.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	16.00	
17.	2,000	Pc	Folder 14 points, shiny, white (long)	6.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	5.20	
18.	100	Pc	Folder 14 points, shiny, white (short)	4.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	3.98	
19.	50	Pc	Gel ink pen 0.5mm (blue & black)	26.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	25.50	

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
20.	10	Bot	Glue 130g, Elmer's	55.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	54.50	
21.	8	Pc	Highlighter (yellow), Stabilo	50.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	46.80	
22.	20	Roll	Masking tape (1") big	30.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	29.55	
23.	5	boxes	Pentel pen (box of 12's), broad, best quality (black), Pilot	540.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	538.00	
24.	2	Bot	Pentel pen Ink refill (black)	90.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	86.00	
25.	160	Pc	Permanent marker, twin tip (sharpie fine, ultra fine), Pilot	50.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	37.00	
26.	15	Book	Record book (cloth bound), 300 pages	450.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	440.00	
27.	15	Book	Record book (cloth bound), 500 pages	500.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	495.00	
28.	1	Bot	Stamp pad ink refill (purple), HBW	100.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	60.00	
29.	16	Box	Staple wire #10 (box of 12's), Max	180.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	156.00	
30.	25	Box	Staple wire standard #35, TM	48.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	40.00	
31.	50	Roll	Tape, transparent (2") w/ usable length of 24mm	30.00	AC/DC Enterprises	AC/DC Enterprises, Dgte. City	29.75	
	<b>7283113</b>							
1.	1	Unit	<b>BIOSAFETY CABINET, Narang, USA with Brochure</b>	450,000.00	Juniper 3 Procurement Corporation	Juniper 3 Procurement Corporation, Muntinlupa City, Metro Manila	447,777.00	
			Internal & External (W*D*H) : 1150*600*660mm, 300*750*2250mm					

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
	Tested Opening : Safety Height 200mm(8*)					
	Maximum Opening : 420mm (17*)					
	Inflow Velocity : 0.5±0.025 m/s					
	Downflow Velocity : 0.33±0.025 m/s					
	HEPA Filter : Two, 99.999% efficiency at 0.3µm. Filter life indicator.					
	Front Window : Motorized. Two-layer laminated toughened glass ≥ 5mm. Anti UV.					
	Noise : EN12469 ≤ 58dB / NSF49 ≤ 61dB					
	UV Lamp : 30W*1, UV timer, UV life indicator, emission of 253.7 nanometers for most efficient decontamination					
	Illuminating Lamp : LED lamp; 14W*2; ≥1000Lux					
	Consumption : 800W					
	Waterproof Sockets : Two, total load of two sockets: 500W					
	Display : LCD display: exhaust filter and downflow filter pressure, filter and UV, UV lamp working time, inflow and downflow velocity, filter life, humidity and					
	Control System : Microprocessor					
	Airflow System : 70% air recirculation, 30% air exhaust					
	Visual and Audio Alarm : Filter replacement, window over height, abnormal air flow velocity					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			Work Zone: 304 stainless steel,					
			Material : Main Body: Cold-rolled and steel with anti-bacteria powder coating.					
			Work Surface Height : 750mm					
			Caster : Footmaster caster					
			Power Supply : AC220V±10%, 50/60Hz; 110V±10%, 60Hz					
			Warranty : 1 year for parts and 2 years for Labor					
	<b>7283143</b>							
1.	1	Unit	Automated External Defibrillator (AED), Adult/Pediatric; Brand: Cardi Aid	150,000.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	146,000.00	
			with one (1) set of Adult Pad and One (1) set of Pediatric Pad.					
2.	2	Pc	Head Immobilizer	3,500.00	No bid	No bid	None	
3.	10	Set	Neck Cervical Collar Adjustable Rigid Brace Whiplash Disc Locked Adjustable	2,000.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	1,998.00	
4.	1	Unit	Foldable Standard Wheelchair (heavy duty)	10,000.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	7,550.00	
5.	4	Set	Rescue Spine Borad with spider strap (lightweight)	15,000.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	9,999.00	
6.	20	Set	Headlamp (Water Proof), Heavy Duty	4,700.00	J-Sam's Link Trading	J-Sam's Link Trading, Amlan, Neg. Or.	4,680.00	
			- Max output: 1000 lumens					
			- Beam Color: whitelight					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			Includes: Rechargeable battery and charger					
	<b>7239005</b>							<b>10-Nov-20</b>
1.	1	Unit	Motor Grader, Brand New, LIUGONG CLG414 China	10,000,000.00	KJMB Commercial	KJMB Commercial, Quezon City, Metro Manila	8,888,000.00	
			Gen. Specs:					
			- Articulated Unit					
			- 6 cylinder diesel engine, Dongfeng/ Cummins DCEC 6BTAA59-C160					
			- Minimum operating weight, 12.8 tons					
			- Minimum rated power, 160HP					
			- Minimum Blade length, 3.6 Meter					
			- Includes 3-Prolonged Ripper and Scarifier, Mid Mounted					
			- Warranty One (1) year					
2.	1	Unit	Backhoe Loader with Breaker Line (Brand New), CASE 570 ST USA	9,500,000.00	Filholland Corporation	Filholland Corporation, Cagayan De Oro City, Misamis Oriental	5,432,100.00	
			Gen. Specs:					



	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Four (4) Cylinder Diesel Engine, 8045.45.748					
			- Minimum rated power: 96Hp					
			- Minimum Bucket Capacity (Digging), 0.30 Cu.M					
			- Minimum Bucket Capacity (Loading), 1.00 Cu.M					
			- Side Shift/ Center Pivot Backhoe					
			- With One (1) unit Rock Breaker (Compatible unit), DEMOLEX Brand					
			- Warranty One (1) year					
3.	1	Unit	Bulldozer (Brand New), LIUGONG B160C China	11,500,000.00	KJMB Commercial	KJMB Commercial, Quezon City, Metro Manila	8,888,000.00	
			Gen. Specs:					
			- Six (6) Cylinder diesel engine, WECHAI WD10617B625					
			- Minimum operating weight: 17 tons					
			- Minimum rated power: 160 hp					
			- Minimum gradeability: 30 deg.					
			- Minimum blade width: 3.785 meter (blade type-angle)					
			- Minimum blade height: 1.076 meter (blade type-angle)					
			- Hydraulic Pump- Gear type					
			- Includes 3-Pronged Shank Ripper					

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
			- Warranty: One (1) year					
	<b>118305</b>							<b>24-Nov-20</b>
1.	1	Unit	Four-wheel passenger van type vehicle, Nissan Urvan NV350 Premium ATS	3,000,000.00	Ponce Automobile Corporation	Ponce Automobile Corporation, Bacolod City	2,850,000.00	
			- Brand new, Automatic transmission					
			- Engine:2.5 sp 4 In-line DOHC 16-valve Variable turbocharged (VGS) with inter-cooler diesel.					
			- Displacement: 2,488cc					
			- 65 liters fuel tank capacity					
			- Suspension/Brakes:					
			- Torsion Bar with Stabilizer/Leaf Spring					
			- Ventilated Disc/Drum					
			- Equipped					
			- Maximum 12 persons seating capacity					
			- Tires: 195 R15C, tubeless					
			- Wheels: 15-inch steel with full wheel cover					
			- Steering Function:3-spoke Urethane Type					
			- Equipped/ Manual					
			- Minimum ground clearance-195 mm					
	<b>160244</b>							<b>1-Dec-20</b>

	Reference No.		Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
1.	500	Pack	Sanitary napkin, 8'S, Sisters	50.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	47.00	
2.	500	Roll	Tissue paper, 2 Ply, Toilly	25.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	23.00	
3.	500	Bot	Alcohol, 150 ML, Green Cross	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	72.00	
4.	500	Bot	Shampoo, Palmolive 90ml	100.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	99.50	
5.	500	Tube	Toothpaste, Colgate 25g	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	71.00	
6.	500	Pc	Toothbrush, Colgate	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	72.00	
7.	500	Pack	Beauty Soap , Palmolive 115 g	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	73.00	
8.	500	Bar	Detergent soap bar, Surf	35.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	34.00	
9.	65	Pc	Digital Thermometer	150.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	145.00	
10.	100	Pack	Diaper small, medium	75.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	72.00	
11.	500	Pack	Cotton buds	25.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	25.00	
12.	500	Bot	Sodium Hypochlorite with anti-bacterial bleach, 250 ml, Zonrox	50.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	48.00	
	<b>160534</b>							
1.	450	Bag	Portland Cement (40kg./bag), Grand Premium	260.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	241.00	
2.	90	CuM	Sand, washed	700.00	Verlyn's Enterprises	Verlyn's Enterprises, Dgte. City	640.00	
3.	48	Pc	G.melina, 2"x2"x12'	128.00	No bid.	No bid.	None	

	Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
--	---------------	------------------	------------------------------	----------------	----------------------------	------------	-----------------

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

Prepared by:

**CHAVELLE F. ALONSO**  
Member- BAC Secretariat

**RONILO N. CABLAO**  
BAC Secretariat Head

**MA. ANGELES SOCORRO A. A. BANOON, CE, EnP, CSEE**  
BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

Republic of the Philippines  
CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT

Province, City or Municipality: **Bais City**  
**4th Quarter, CY 2020**

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Location	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
- N/A -									

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

Prepared by:

**CHAVELLE F. ALONSO**  
Member- BAC Secretariat

**RONILO N. CABLAO**  
BAC Secretariat Head

**MA. ANGELES SOCORRO A. A. BANOGON, CE, EnP, CSEE**  
BAC Chairperson